
 

I would like some information and data in relation to complaints concerning Prevent Referrals (under the 
CTSA 2015 Prevent Duty, the Prevent Guidance and the Channel Guidance). I believe this information is 
held by the West Yorkshire Police Prevent Board. 
 
In particular I would like information and data in relation to the West Yorkshire Police Force: 
   1. How many complaints (both recorded and not recorded) have been lodged with the West Yorkshire 
Police service about Prevent referrals and Channel programme referrals from 2014 to date. I would like 
data on both recorded and not recorded since the decision not to record also has to be explained the 
complainant so is likely to be quantifiable. 
2. Statistics on the different grounds for complaint. 
3. Whether any of these complaints has been referred to the IOPC and its predecessor the IPCC. 
4. How many complaints resulted in a local resolution and a break down in statistics on the types of 
resolution agreed. 
5. How many of these complaints resulted in an investigation and what the outcomes of the investigation 
were. 
6. Whether any complaint outcomes were appealed. 
 
I am not seeking any identifying data or to see the content of the complaints, merely the data relevant to 
recording of complaints (in accordance with requirements set out in Policing and Crime Act 2017 and the 
IPCC 2015 Statutory guidance- until the new guidance is available and operational). 
 
West Yorkshire Police can neither confirm nor deny, that we hold the information you have requested as 
the duty in s1(1)(a) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 does not apply by virtue of: 
 
Section 30(3) Investigations 
Section 31(3) Law Enforcement 
Section 40(5) Personal Information.  
  
However, this should not be taken as conclusive evidence that the information you requested exists or 
does not exist.  
  
Please see Appendix A for the full legislative explanation.   
  
  
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 



Appendix A 
  
The Freedom of Information Act 2000, creates a statutory right of access to information held by Public 
Authorities.  A Public Authority in receipt of a request, must if permitted state under Section 1(a) of the 
FOI Act, whether it holds the requested information and if held, then communicate that information to the 
applicant, under Section 1(b) of the Act.  
  
The right of access to information is not without exception and is subject to a number of exemptions. 
These exemptions are designed to enable public authorities, to withhold information that is unsuitable for 
release.  
  
Importantly the Act is designed to place information into the public domain, so that is accessible if 
granted to one person under the Act. It is then considered public information and must be communicated 
to any individual, should a request be received.  
  
Decision  
  
This letter serves as a Refusal Notice under Section 17 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000.    
  
Section 17 of the Act provides:  
  
(1)  A public authority which, in relation to any request for information, is to any extent relying on a Claim, 
that information is exempt information must within the time for complying with Section 1(1), giving the 
applicant a notice which:-  
  
(a) States the fact,  
(b) Specifies the exemption in question, and  
(c) States (if that would not otherwise be apparent) why the exemption applies.  
  
Reason for decision.  
  
The West Yorkshire Police Service can neither confirm nor deny, that it holds the information you  
requested, as the duty in s1(1)(a) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 does not apply. By virtue of 
the following exemptions:  
  
Section 30(3) Investigations 
Section 31(3) Law Enforcement 
Section 40(5) Personal information 
 
Section 30 is a qualified and class based exemption and as such there is no requirement to provide 
evidence of harm, however there is a requirement to conduct a public interest test in confirmation or 
denial. 
 
Section 40 is a class based absolute exemption and as such there is no requirement to provide evidence 
of the harm or consider the public interest findings as to whether neither confirming nor denying 
information is held is appropriate. 
 
Section 31 is a qualified and prejudice based exemption therefore there requires a public interest test 
and the harm (prejudice) in confirming or denying is evidenced below. 
  
 
Harm in complying with Section 1 (1) (a) to confirm or not whether information is held 
 
Although every effort should be made to release information under Freedom of Information, to confirm or 
deny whether information is or isn’t held relating to complaints about prevent referrals would undermine 
policing and destroy public trust in West Yorkshire Police. 
 



To confirm or deny information is held in relation to this request has the potential to undermine police 
work, ongoing investigations and ultimately undermine or misrepresent the prevent programme as a 
whole. Conformation or denial that information is held relating to complaints regarding prevent referrals 
has the potential to infer intelligence that is or isn’t held at a force level. This would damage the public 
confidence in the force and how it handles sensitive information, potentially deterring future referrals. 
Whilst there is a public interest in the transparency of policing, providing assurance that the Police 
Service is appropriately and effectively engaging with the threat from criminals, this should be countered 
against the need to protect vulnerable areas, and ongoing Policing operational activity. 
 
Public Interest Test 
 
Factors favouring confirmation or denial for Section 31 
Confirmation or denial that any information is held relevant to the request would lead to a better informed 
public understanding of how West Yorkshire Police handle complaints around prevent referrals. 
 
Factors against confirmation or denial for Section 31 
Confirmation or denial that any information is held relevant to the request could diminish public 
confidence in the Force’s ability to deal with complaints in sensitive matters, thus deterring potential 
future referrals or complaints. In confirming or denying whether any information is held could highlight 
the way in which West Yorkshire Police work to support those involved or affected by prevent referrals. 
 
Factors favouring confirmation or denial for Section 30 
Confirmation or denial that any information is held in respect of this request would ensure transparency 
into the policing operations, providing assurance that West Yorkshire Police is appropriately and 
effectively dealing with complaints around prevent referrals. 
 
Factors against confirmation or denial for Section 30 
Confirmation or denial that any information is held in respect of the request could highlight any 
intelligence held or not held for prevent referrals at force level, thus undermining police investigations 
past, present or future.  
 
Balance test 
Whilst there is a public interest for transparency of policing operations and providing assurances to the 
public that West Yorkshire Police is effectively and appropriately dealing with any complaints that arise 
around prevent referrals. There is a very high public interest in protecting the integrity of police 
operations in this highly sensitive area. 
 
The Police Service is charged with enforcing the law, preventing and detecting crime and protecting the 
communities we serve. West Yorkshire Police will not disclose whether any information is or isn’t held 
that if confirmed or denied would place these communities at risk or compromise the working of law 
enforcement.  
 
It is for these reasons that the public interest test must favour neither confirming nor denying that the 
information requested is held. 
 
However this should not be taken as conclusive evidence that any information that would meet your 
request exists or does not exist.   
  
Please note that police forces do not use generic systems or identical procedures, for capturing the 
requested data.  For these reasons, this response to your questions should not be used for comparison 
purposes, with responses you may receive from other police forces.  
  
  
    
 
 

 
 


